
Company Name Required Quote # Supplies Hardback, 

Pre-Bound, 

Paperback 

Books,       

E-Books

Catalog

1 ABDO **Opal Booz Approved Vendor

2 Barnes & Noble Booksellers, Inc. 835645 Primary Approved Vendor

3 Bearport Publishing **Opal Booz Approved Vendor

4 Booksource (GL Group Inc.) Approved Vendor

5 Bound to Stay Bounds Books, Inc. Approved Vendor

6 Capstone (Coughlan Companies LLC) Approved Vendor

7 Cavendish Square Publishing LLC**Opal Booz Approved Vendor

8 Cerebellum Corporation Approved Vendor

9 Children's Plus Inc.  **Opal Booz Secondary Approved Vendor

10 Complete Book & Media Supply LLC Approved Vendor

11 Delaney Educational Enterprises Approved Vendor

12 DLB Books, Inc. Approved Vendor

13 EBSCO Information Services Approved Vendor

14 Educators Publishing Serv (School Specialty) 7788552668 Approved Vendor

15 Enslow Publishing LLC **Opal Booz Approved Vendor

16 Follett School Solutions Inc. Primary Approved Vendor

17 Gale/Cengage Learning Inc. 18-026-10-19 Approved Vendor

18 Gareth Stevens Publishing ** Opal Booz Approved Vendor

19 Garrett Book Company Approved Vendor

20 Greenhaven Publishing LLC**Opal Booz Approved Vendor

21 Gumdrop Books (Central Programs Inc.) 18-026-10-19 Approved Vendor

22 Ingram Library Services LLC Approved Vendor

23 Junior Library Guild (MT Library Services Inc.) Approved Vendor

24 KAPCO (Kent Adhesive Products Co) 18-026-10-19 Approved Vendor

25 Lakeshore Learning Materials "per bid 18-026-10-19" Approved Vendor

26 Lectorum Publications, Inc. 18-026-10-19 Approved Vendor

27 Lerner Publishing Group Approved Vendor

28 The Library Store, Inc TXSAISD Primary Approved Vendor

29 Mackin Educational Resources SANANG Secondary Approved Vendor

30 Mitinet Inc. Approved Vendor

31 OPAL BOOZ & Associates** Primary Approved Vendor

32 OverDrive, Inc. Approved Vendor

33 Perma-Bound Books (Hertzberg-New Method, Inc) 18-026-10-19 Primary Approved Vendor

34 Rainbow Book Company Approved Vendor

35 Renaissance Learning, Inc. call for a quote # Approved Vendor

36 Rosen Publishing Group, Inc. ** Opal Booz Approved Vendor

37 Saddleback Educational, Inc. 18-026-10-19 Approved Vendor

38 Scholastic Library Publishing Inc. Approved Vendor

39 School Specialty, Inc. 7788527176 Secondary Approved Vendor

40 Textbook Warehouse LLC Approved Vendor
41 WT Cox Information Services 18-026-10-19 Approved Vendor



18-026-10-19 LIBRARY BOOKS

HARDBACK

ITEM - HARDBACK BOOKS
Barnes and 

Noble

Children's 

Plus

Delaney 

Ed DLB Books

Follett 

School 

Solutions

Ingram 

Library 

Services Mackin

Opal Booz 

Associates

Perma 

Bound

Rainbow 

Book

PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Elementary Books 835645

1 The Lumberjack’s Beard by Duncan Beedie 16.99 16.99 14.64 10.53 15.01 14.64 14.44 16.99

2 Hector the Collector by Emily Beeny 14.39 17.99 17.99 15.49 11.15 15.06 15.49 15.29 17.99

3 My Journey to the Stars by Scott Kelly 17.99 17.99 15.99 11.15 15.06 15.49 15.29 17.99

4 Egg by Kevin Henkes 14.39 17.99 17.99 16.16 11.15 14.72 15.49 15.29 17.99

5

Who Wants to Be a Princess?: What It Was Really Like to Be a Medieval Princess by Bridget 

Heos
13.59 16.99 16.99 14.64 10.53 14.22

14.64 14.44 16.99

6 Grand Canyon by Jason Chin 15.99 19.99 19.99 17.19 12.39 16.73 17.19 16.99 19.99

7 A Hundred Billion Trillion Stars by Seth Fisherman 14.39 17.99 17.99 15.49 11.15 14.72 15.49 15.29 17.99

8

Quest for Z : The True Story of Explorer Percy Fawcett and the Lost City of the Amazon by Greg 

Pizzoli,
14.39 17.99 17.99 15.49 11.15 15.89

15.49 15.29 17.99

9 Sergeant Reckless: The Story of a Little Horse Who Became a Hero by Patricia McCormick
14.39 17.99 17.99 15.49 11.15 15.06

15.49 15.29 17.99

10 Two Truths and a Lie: It's Alive! by Ammi-Joan Paquette 14.39 17.99 17.99 15.49 11.15 15.06 15.49 15.29 17.99

11

Step Right Up: How Doc and Jim Key Taught the World About Kindness  by Donna Janell 

Bowman Illustrated by Daniel Minter.
15.96 19.95 19.95 17.16 12.37 17.62

17.16 19.95
12 Bravo! Poems About Amazing Hispanics by Margarita Engle Illustrated by Rafael López 15.19 18.99 18.99 16.34 10.53 15.89 16.34 16.14 18.99

13

Illustrated by Joelle Dreidemy. The Unlucky Lottery Winners of Classroom 13. By Matthew J. 

Gilbert and Honest Lee. 
12.79 15.99 15.99 9.91 13.38

14.44 13.59 15.99

14 Refugee by Alan Gratz 13.59 16.99 16.99 14.64 10.53 13.75 14.64 14.44 16.99

15 Amina’s Voice by Hena Khan 13.59 16.99 16.99 14.64 10.53 13.43 14.64 14.44 16.99

16 Me and Marvin Gardens by Amy Sarig King 13.59 16.99 16.99 14.64 10.53 13.75 14.64 14.44 16.99

17

Chef Roy Choi and the Street Food Remix by Jacqueline Briggs Martin and June Jo Lee. 

 Illustrated by Man One
15.16 18.95 18.95 16.31 11.75 16.74

16.34 16.11 18.95

18 The Bicycle Spy. By Yona Zeldis McDonough 13.59 16.99 16.99 14.64 10.53 13.75 14.64 14.44 16.99

19 Spirit Hunters by Ellen Oh 13.59 16.99 16.99 10.53 14.22 14.64 14.44 16.99

20 Stef Soto, Taco Queen by Jennifer Torres 13.59 16.99 16.99 14.64 10.53 14.22 14.64 14.44 16.99



18-026-10-19 LIBRARY BOOKS

HARDBACK

ITEM - HARDBACK BOOKS
Barnes and 

Noble

Children's 

Plus

Delaney 

Ed DLB Books

Follett 

School 

Solutions

Ingram 

Library 

Services Mackin

Opal Booz 

Associates

Perma 

Bound

Rainbow 

Book

PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Secondary Books 
1 The Hate U Give by Angie Thomas 15.19 18.99 18.99 18.99 16.34 11.77 15.54 16.34 17.84

2 City of Saints and Thieves by Natalie C. Anderson 15.19 18.99 18.99 18.99 16.34 11.77 15.89 16.34 16.14

3 The Sun is Also a Star by Nicola Yoon 15.19 18.99 18.99 18.99 16.34 11.77 15.89 16.34 16.14

4 All in Pieces by Suzanne Young 14.39 17.99 17.99 17.99 15.49 11.15 14.22 15.49 15.29

5 Words in Deep Blue by Cath Crowley 14.39 17.99 17.99 17.99 15.49 11.15 15.06 15.49 15.29

6 Undefeated by Steve Sheinkin 15.99 19.99 19.99 19.99 17.49 12.39 16.73 17.19 16.99

7 Uprooted by Albert Marrin 14.39 17.99 17.99 17.99 20.99 11.15 15.06 15.49 17.84

8

Eyes of the World: Robert Capa, Gerda Taro, and the Invention of Modern Photojournalism 

written by Marc Aronson and Marina Budhos
18.39 22.99 22.99 22.00 19.74 14.25 19.24

19.74 18.29

9

The 57 Bus: A True Story of Two Teenagers and the Crime That Changed Their Lives written by 

Dashka Slater
14.39 17.99 17.99 17.99 19.99 11.15 15.06

15.49 15.29

10 Plot to Kill Hitler: Dietrich Bonhoeffer, Pastor, Spy, Unlikely Hero by Patricia McCormick 15.19 18.99 18.99 18.99 16.34 11.77 15.89 16.34 16.14

11 As Brave as You by Jason Reynolds 13.59 16.99 16.99 16.99 14.64 10.53 13.43 14.64 14.44

12 Girls Who Code : Learn to Code and Change the World  by Reshma Saujani 14.39 17.99 17.99 17.99 15.49 11.15 15.06 15.40 15.29

13 Rebound by Kwame Alexander 8.49 16.99 16.99 16.99 14.64 10.53 13.90 14.62 14.44

14 Refugee by Alan Gratz 13.59 16.99 16.99 16.99 14.64 10.53 13.75 14.64 14.44

15 Slider by Pete Hautman 13.59 16.99 16.99 16.95 14.64 10.53 15.01 14.64 14.44

16 Twelve Days In May : Freedom Ride 1961 by Larry Dane Brimner 15.16 18.95 18.95 18.95 16.31 11.75 15.87 16.31 15.26

17 Undefeated : Jim Thorpe and the Carlisle Indian School Football Team by Steve Sheinkin 15.99 19.99 19.99 19.95 17.19 12.39 16.73 17.19 17.48

18 Vincent And Theo by Deborah Heiligman 15.99 19.99 19.99 19.95 17.19 12.39 16.73 17.19 16.99

19

The Way Things Work Now : From Levers to Lasers, Windmills to Wi-Fi, A Visual Guide to the 

World of Machines by David Macaulay
28.00 35.00 35.00 32.00 29.95 21.70 28.64

29.95 29.75
20 Wishtree by Katherine Applegate 16.99 16.99 16.99 21.64 10.53 14.22 14.64 16.99



18-026-10-19 LIBRARY BOOKS

PRE-BOUND

ITEM - PRE-BOUND

Bound to 

Stay Bound

Children's 

Plus Delaney Ed DLB Books

Follett 

School 

Solutions

Ingram 

Library 

Services Mackin

Opal Booz 

Associates

Perma 

Bound

Rainbow 

Book

PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Elementary Books 

1 The Lumberjack’s Beard by Duncan Beedie 19.61 19.51

2 Hector the Collector by Emily Beeny 20.31 20.28

3 My Journey to the Stars by Scott Kelly 20.31 10.81 20.28

4 Egg by Kevin Henkes 20.31 19.41 20.28

5

Who Wants to Be a Princess?: What It Was Really Like to Be a Medieval Princess by Bridget 

Heos 19.61 19.51

6 Grand Canyon by Jason Chin 21.71 21.80

7 A Hundred Billion Trillion Stars by Seth Fisherman 20.31

8

Quest for Z : The True Story of Explorer Percy Fawcett and the Lost City of the Amazon by 

Greg Pizzoli, 20.31 20.28

9 Sergeant Reckless: The Story of a Little Horse Who Became a Hero by Patricia McCormick 20.31 19.41 20.28

10 Two Truths and a Lie: It's Alive! by Ammi-Joan Paquette 20.31 15.71 14.49 15.95

11

Step Right Up: How Doc and Jim Key Taught the World About Kindness  by Donna Janell 

Bowman Illustrated by Daniel Minter. 21.69 20.81 21.79

12 Bravo! Poems About Amazing Hispanics by Margarita Engle Illustrated by Rafael López 21.01 20.11 9.98 21.04

13

Illustrated by Joelle Dreidemy. The Unlucky Lottery Winners of Classroom 13. By Matthew J. 

Gilbert and Honest Lee. 18.91 14.95 14.95 11.01 9.92 11.89 14.95

14 Refugee by Alan Gratz 19.61 18.71 19.28

15 Amina’s Voice by Hena Khan 19.61 17.95 17.95 13.18 11.41 11.37 13.42 17.95

16 Me and Marvin Gardens by Amy Sarig King 19.61 13.51 13.42

17

Chef Roy Choi and the Street Food Remix by Jacqueline Briggs Martin and June Jo Lee. 

 Illustrated by Man One 20.99 20.11 21.01

18 The Bicycle Spy. By Yona Zeldis McDonough 19.61 18.71 19.28

19 Spirit Hunters by Ellen Oh 19.61 16.95 16.95 12.41 11.32 12.65 16.95

20 Stef Soto, Taco Queen by Jennifer Torres 19.61 24.95 24.95 18.71 10.66 10.67 12.65 24.95



18-026-10-19 LIBRARY BOOKS

PRE-BOUND

ITEM - PRE-BOUND

Bound to 

Stay Bound

Children's 

Plus Delaney Ed DLB Books

Follett 

School 

Solutions

Ingram 

Library 

Services Mackin

Opal Booz 

Associates

Perma 

Bound

Rainbow 

Book

PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE PRICE

Secondary Books

1 The Hate U Give by Angie Thomas 20.31 NA 20.11 13.70 20.80

2 City of Saints and Thieves by Natalie C. Anderson 21.01 22.95 22.95 15.71 14.49 15.71 15.71 22.95

3 The Sun is Also a Star by Nicola Yoon 21.01 21.99 20.11 20.80

4 All in Pieces by Suzanne Young 20.31 15.71 13.46

5 Words in Deep Blue by Cath Crowley 20.31 20.95 20.95 20.95 14.91 14.91 14.94 20.95

6 Undefeated by Steve Sheinkin 27.71 20.81 20.81 21.80

7 Uprooted by Albert Marrin 20.31 20.99 19.41 20.28

8

Eyes of the World: Robert Capa, Gerda Taro, and the Invention of Modern Photojournalism 

written by Marc Aronson and Marina Budhos 23.81 22.91 14.18

9

The 57 Bus: A True Story of Two Teenagers and the Crime That Changed Their Lives written 

by Dashka Slater 20.31 19.41 20.04

10 Plot to Kill Hitler: Dietrich Bonhoeffer, Pastor, Spy, Unlikely Hero by Patricia McCormick 21.01 20.95 20.95 20.11 7.90 20.11 14.94 20.95

11 As Brave as You by Jason Reynolds 19.61 17.95 17.95 11.41 11.37 13.42 17.95

12 Girls Who Code : Learn to Code and Change the World  by Reshma Saujani 20.31 22.95 22.95 14.49 15.71 22.95

13 Rebound by Kwame Alexander 19.61 18.71 19.28

14 Refugee by Alan Gratz 19.61 18.71 19.28

15 Slider by Pete Hautman 19.61 18.71 13.42

16 Twelve Days In May : Freedom Ride 1961 by Larry Dane Brimner 20.99 20.11 21.01

17 Undefeated : Jim Thorpe and the Carlisle Indian School Football Team by Steve Sheinkin 21.71 20.81 17.25

18 Vincent And Theo by Deborah Heiligman 21.71 20.81 21.57

19

The Way Things Work Now : From Levers to Lasers, Windmills to Wi-Fi, A Visual Guide to the 

World of Machines by David Macaulay 32.22
20 Wishtree by Katherine Applegate 19.61 18.71 19.54



18-026-10-19 LIBRARY BOOKS

PAPERBACK

ITEM - PAPERBACK
Barnes and 

Noble

Children's 

Plus

Delaney 

Ed DLB Books

Follett 

School 

Solutions

Ingram 

Library 

Services Mackin

Opal Booz 

Associates

Perma 

Bound

Rainbow 

Book

Price Price Price PRICE Price Price Price Price Price Price

Elementary Books 

1 The Lumberjack’s Beard by Duncan Beedie 13.59

2 Hector the Collector by Emily Beeny

3 My Journey to the Stars by Scott Kelly 14.39 4.34 3.19

4 Egg by Kevin Henkes

5

Who Wants to Be a Princess?: What It Was Really Like to Be a Medieval Princess by Bridget 

Heos

6 Grand Canyon by Jason Chin

7 A Hundred Billion Trillion Stars by Seth Fisherman

8

Quest for Z : The True Story of Explorer Percy Fawcett and the Lost City of the Amazon by 

Greg Pizzoli,

9 Sergeant Reckless: The Story of a Little Horse Who Became a Hero by Patricia McCormick

10 Two Truths and a Lie: It's Alive! by Ammi-Joan Paquette 8.79 9.44 7.03 8.69 9.34

11

Step Right Up: How Doc and Jim Key Taught the World About Kindness  by Donna Janell 

Bowman Illustrated by Daniel Minter.

12 Bravo! Poems About Amazing Hispanics by Margarita Engle Illustrated by Rafael López 4.18

13

Illustrated by Joelle Dreidemy. The Unlucky Lottery Winners of Classroom 13. By Matthew J. 

Gilbert and Honest Lee. 4.79 5.99 5.99 5.19 3.83 5.09 5.99

14 Refugee by Alan Gratz

15 Amina’s Voice by Hena Khan 6.39 7.99 7.99 6.89 5.11 5.57 6.79 7.99

16 Me and Marvin Gardens by Amy Sarig King 6.39 6.89 5.11

17

Chef Roy Choi and the Street Food Remix by Jacqueline Briggs Martin and June Jo Lee. 

 Illustrated by Man One

18 The Bicycle Spy. By Yona Zeldis McDonough 6.39

19 Spirit Hunters by Ellen Oh 5.59 6.99 6.99 6.04 4.47 5.52 5.94 6.99

20 Stef Soto, Taco Queen by Jennifer Torres 5.59 12.99 12.99 6.04 4.47 4.87 5.94 12.99



18-026-10-19 LIBRARY BOOKS

PAPERBACK

ITEM - PAPERBACK
Barnes and 

Noble

Children's 

Plus

Delaney 

Ed DLB Books

Follett 

School 

Solutions

Ingram 

Library 

Services Mackin

Opal Booz 

Associates

Perma 

Bound

Rainbow 

Book

Price Price Price PRICE Price Price Price Price Price Price

Secondary Books 

1 The Hate U Give by Angie Thomas 15.19 7.15 7.90

2 City of Saints and Thieves by Natalie C. Anderson 8.79 10.99 10.99 10.99 9.44 8.69 9.44 10.99

3 The Sun is Also a Star by Nicola Yoon 15.19 14.99 11.14

4 All in Pieces by Suzanne Young 8.79 10.99 10.99 10.99 9.44 7.66 9.44 9.34 10.99

5 Words in Deep Blue by Cath Crowley 7.99 9.99 9.99 9.99 8.59 6.39 8.49 9.99

6 Undefeated by Steve Sheinkin 10.39 11.14 8.31 11.14

7 Uprooted by Albert Marrin

8

Eyes of the World: Robert Capa, Gerda Taro, and the Invention of Modern Photojournalism 

written by Marc Aronson and Marina Budhos 18.39 7.64

9

The 57 Bus: A True Story of Two Teenagers and the Crime That Changed Their Lives written 

by Dashka Slater 14.39 11.78

10 Plot to Kill Hitler: Dietrich Bonhoeffer, Pastor, Spy, Unlikely Hero by Patricia McCormick 7.99 9.99 9.99 9.30 8.59 6.39 8.59 8.49 9.99

11 As Brave as You by Jason Reynolds 6.39 7.99 7.99 7.99 6.89 5.11 5.57 6.89 11.04 7.99

12 Girls Who Code : Learn to Code and Change the World  by Reshma Saujani 8.79 10.99 10.99 10.99 9.44 7.03 8.69 9.99 9.34 10.99

13 Rebound by Kwame Alexander 11.85

14 Refugee by Alan Gratz 10.88

15 Slider by Pete Hautman 6.39 7.75 5.11

16 Twelve Days In May : Freedom Ride 1961 by Larry Dane Brimner

17 Undefeated : Jim Thorpe and the Carlisle Indian School Football Team by Steve Sheinkin 10.39 12.99 11.14 8.31

18 Vincent And Theo by Deborah Heiligman

19

The Way Things Work Now : From Levers to Lasers, Windmills to Wi-Fi, A Visual Guide to the 

World of Machines by David Macaulay

20 Wishtree by Katherine Applegate 13.59 15.99 13.59 10.23



18-026-10-19 LIBRARY BOOKS

EBOOK

ITEM - EBOOK #
Follett 

School 

Solutions TERMS

Price
Elementary Books 

1 The Lumberjack’s Beard by Duncan Beedie
2 Hector the Collector by Emily Beeny
3 My Journey to the Stars by Scott Kelly
4 Egg by Kevin Henkes

5

Who Wants to Be a Princess?: What It Was Really Like to Be a Medieval Princess by Bridget 

Heos

6 Grand Canyon by Jason Chin 15.00

12 month 

access

7 A Hundred Billion Trillion Stars by Seth Fisherman

8

Quest for Z : The True Story of Explorer Percy Fawcett and the Lost City of the Amazon by 

Greg Pizzoli, 53.97 single user

9 Sergeant Reckless: The Story of a Little Horse Who Became a Hero by Patricia McCormick

10 Two Truths and a Lie: It's Alive! by Ammi-Joan Paquette 17.99 26 checkouts

11

Step Right Up: How Doc and Jim Key Taught the World About Kindness  by Donna Janell 

Bowman Illustrated by Daniel Minter. 19.95 single user

12 Bravo! Poems About Amazing Hispanics by Margarita Engle Illustrated by Rafael López 15.00

12 month 

access

13

Illustrated by Joelle Dreidemy. The Unlucky Lottery Winners of Classroom 13. By Matthew J. 

Gilbert and Honest Lee. 48.00 single user

14 Refugee by Alan Gratz

15 Amina’s Voice by Hena Khan 7.99

12 month 

access

16 Me and Marvin Gardens by Amy Sarig King 16.99

24 month 

access

17

Chef Roy Choi and the Street Food Remix by Jacqueline Briggs Martin and June Jo Lee. 

 Illustrated by Man One

18 The Bicycle Spy. By Yona Zeldis McDonough 16.99

24 month 

access

19 Spirit Hunters by Ellen Oh

20 Stef Soto, Taco Queen by Jennifer Torres 51.00 single user



18-026-10-19 LIBRARY BOOKS

EBOOK

ITEM - EBOOK #
Follett 

School 

Solutions TERMS

Secondary Books 
1 The Hate U Give by Angie Thomas 18.99 26 checkouts

2 City of Saints and Thieves by Natalie C. Anderson 32.97 single user
3 The Sun is Also a Star by Nicola Yoon 56.97 single user

4 All in Pieces by Suzanne Young 9.4412 month access
5 Words in Deep Blue by Cath Crowley 29.97 single user
6 Undefeated by Steve Sheinkin

7 Uprooted by Albert Marrin 53.97 single user

8

Eyes of the World: Robert Capa, Gerda Taro, and the Invention of Modern Photojournalism 

written by Marc Aronson and Marina Budhos 15.00

12 month 

access

9

The 57 Bus: A True Story of Two Teenagers and the Crime That Changed Their Lives written 

by Dashka Slater

10 Plot to Kill Hitler: Dietrich Bonhoeffer, Pastor, Spy, Unlikely Hero by Patricia McCormick 18.99 26 checkouts

11 As Brave as You by Jason Reynolds 7.99

12 month 

access

12 Girls Who Code : Learn to Code and Change the World  by Reshma Saujani 32.97 single user

13 Rebound by Kwame Alexander 16.99 single user

14 Refugee by Alan Gratz 16.99

24 month 

access

15 Slider by Pete Hautman 16.99 single user

16 Twelve Days In May : Freedom Ride 1961 by Larry Dane Brimner 9.99 single user

17 Undefeated : Jim Thorpe and the Carlisle Indian School Football Team by Steve Sheinkin

18 Vincent And Theo by Deborah Heiligman 15.00

12 month 

access

19

The Way Things Work Now : From Levers to Lasers, Windmills to Wi-Fi, A Visual Guide to the 

World of Machines by David Macaulay 35.00 single user

20 Wishtree by Katherine Applegate 25.00

12 month 

access



18-026-10-19 Library Books, Periodicals, Supplies, Equipment and Furniture

EFFECTIVE 11/01/18 - 10/31/19

COMPANY:

ABDO Publishing Company

MUST USE OPAL BOOZ

Barnes & Nobles 

Booksellers

Bearport Publishing

MUST USE OPAL BOOZ Booksource (GL Group, Inc) Bound to Stay Bound

Capstone Publishers 

(Coughlan Companies LLC)

Cavendish Square Publishing, 

LLC

MUST USE OPAL BOOZ

ADDRESS:

PO Box 398166

Minneapolis, MN 55439

2617 West Loop 250N

Midland, TX 79705

45 West 21st Street, Ste 3B

New York, NY 10010

1230 Macklind Avenue

St Louis, MO 63110

1880 West Morton

Jacksonville, IL 62650

1710 Roe Crest Drive

North Mankato, MN 56003

243 5th Avenue, Suite 136

New York, NY 10016

CONTACT NAME: Joslyn Lillion Jim L Oberbrockling Kathryn Camisa Lindsey Rug Lori Smith Doug Smith Jenny Speed

PHONE #: 800.800.1312 432.682.8880 877.337.8577 800.444.0435 800.637.6586 507.385.8421 877.980.4450

FAX #: 800.862.3480 432.682.8828 866.337.8557 866.213.9851 800.747.2872 888.262.0705 877.980.4456

E-MAIL: bids@abdopublishing.com crm2686@bn.com kcamisa@bearportpublishing.com bids@booksource.com sales@btsb.com bids@capstonepub.com bids@csqpub.com

WEB ADDRESS: www.abdopublishing.com www.bn.com www.bearportpublishing.com www.booksource.com www.btsb.com www.capstonepub.com www.cavendishsq.com
REQUIRED QUOTE #: 835645

Books

catalog/website reflect

30% off list price 20% 30% 25% 30% from publishers list 25% off list reflected in catalog 30% off list price reflected

Library Equipment 20%

Library Furniture

Library Supplies 20%

Periodicals

DVD's 20%

Video's 20%

CD's 20%

Miscellaneous

DEVIATIONS:

Local Rep: Opal Booz

Candy Freiheit

866.737.7910 NO

Bearport is an independent publisher 

and does not publish any of the listed 

titles in the bid.  A separate price list of 

example titles included in bid 

documents

Please see enclosed clarifications pages 

for the specialized items available to the 

District no NO

Number of titles readily available in inventory: 1,087 37,000 18,000 15,000 1,800

Fill Rate: 99% 100.0% 99.0% 1st shipment 93% 93% first shipment, 99% or better 100.0%

Time of turn around from order: 7-10 days ARO 5-7 days 7-10 initial; 30-45 for backorders 7-10 working days

7-10 days ARO, processing may be 2-2.5 

wks

7-10 days-unprocessed; 21-30 days library 

processed books

Hardbacks

Class A Buckram binding discount: na NA 25%

30% off pub list plus prebinding 

charge NA

Publisher Library binding discount: 0% 30% off list 25% NB 25% 30% off list price

Publisher Trade binding discount: na 20% NA 25% NB na

Paperback/Pre-Binds

Paperback discount: na 20% 30% off list 25% NB 0-10% 30% off list price

Pre-bound Trade books discount: na NA 25% NB

Pre-bound paperback discount: na NA 25% NB

Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y of N na NO Yes no NA no yes

Video/Media

eBooks discount: 0% 20% 30% off varies NB 25% reflected in catalog 30% off ebooks/interactive ebooks

DVD discount: na 20% NA NB NB NA

Video discount: na 20% NA NB NB NA

Processing and Services
specific documents in bid packet

What is minimum order to get processing: $1.00 no minimum no minimum no minimum no minimum

Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title:

$0.00 attached/unattached

purchase of$350+ free  

NC for spine label & barcode 

attached w/clear protective cover

attached: 0.99 per book

unattached: 0.39 per book free

MARC records price per title: Free w/$350+ purchase free no charge downloaded from web $20.00 per order free

Security strips 3M tattletape price per title:

.30 unattached

.60 attached free $0.50 theft detection is 0.79 per book free

Electronic reviews available? Y or N yes yes YES available on website; NA on MARC records yes

AR Quizzes price per quiz: na $3.50 per title NB Not available; books are AR leveled free

Replacement Policy: see attached bid document 100% for all defective/damaged items

unmarked, uncirculated, unprocessed 

titles may be returned guarantee included in bid documents please see attached 

Customer Service Rep: Candy Freiheit/Opal Booz

local store - Jim 

Oberbrockling Candy Freiheit/Opal Booz Judy Quick 714.960.9295

Katie Walter

kwalter@btsb.com Customer Service 800.747.4992 Arlene Riley

Visitation Schedule: call local rep when requested as needed when requested as needed contact customer serv

Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise: 100% satisfaction; 30 day exchange yes included in bid documents

not completely satisfied call CS we'll 

replace, credit or issue refund, no 

questions asked please see attached 

Send Copy of Warranty: attached yes included in bid documents included yes

mailto:sales@btsb.com
http://www.btsb.com/
mailto:bids@capstonepub.com
http://www.capstonepub.com/
mailto:kcamisa@bearportpublishing.com
mailto:crm2686@bn.com
http://www.bn.com/
http://www.bearportpublishing.com/
mailto:bids@abdopublishing.com
http://www.abdopublishing.com/
mailto:bids@booksource.com
http://www.booksource.com/
mailto:bids@csqpub.com
http://www.cavendishsq.com/


18-026-10-19 Library Books, Periodicals, Supplies, Equipment and Furniture

EFFECTIVE 11/01/18 - 10/31/19

COMPANY:

ADDRESS:

CONTACT NAME:

PHONE #:

FAX #:

E-MAIL:

WEB ADDRESS:

REQUIRED QUOTE #:

Books

Library Equipment

Library Furniture

Library Supplies

Periodicals

DVD's

Video's

CD's

Miscellaneous

DEVIATIONS:

Number of titles readily available in inventory:

Fill Rate:

Time of turn around from order:

Hardbacks

Class A Buckram binding discount:

Publisher Library binding discount:

Publisher Trade binding discount:

Paperback/Pre-Binds

Paperback discount:

Pre-bound Trade books discount:

Pre-bound paperback discount:

Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y of N

Video/Media

eBooks discount:

DVD discount:

Video discount:

Processing and Services

What is minimum order to get processing:

Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title:

MARC records price per title:

Security strips 3M tattletape price per title:

Electronic reviews available? Y or N

AR Quizzes price per quiz:

Replacement Policy:

Customer Service Rep:

Visitation Schedule:

Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise:

Send Copy of Warranty:

Cerebellum Corporation

Children's Plus Inc.

MUST USE OPAL BOOZ

Complete Book & Media 

Supply LLC

Delaney Educaitonal 

Enterprises DLB Books, Inc EBSCO Information Service

145 Corte Madera Town Ctr, Ste 406

Corte Madera, CA 94925

1387 Dutch American Way

Beecher, IL 60401

1200 Toro Grande Drive #200

Cedar Park, TX 78613

1387 Dutch American Way

Beecher, IL 60401

1812 Ave D, Ste 204

Katy, TX 77493

PO BOX 2543

Birmingham, AL 35202

Becky Rena John G. Walsh Kendall Montiegel Dominic Garza Daniella LeCronier Ree Sherer

415.541.9901 ext 202 800.230.1279 512.616.0400 800.788.5557 281.987.0383 800.633.4604

805.426.8136 800.896.7213 512.616.0410 800.660.2199 281.987.8606 205.995.1613

brena@cerebellum.com bids@childrensplusinc.com kendall@completebook.com bids@deebooks.com danielle@dlbbooks.com EBSCONorthAmerica@EBSCO.com

www.dvdsforschools.com www.childrensplusinc.com www.deebooks.com www.dlbbooks.com www.ebsco.com

0-30% reflected on website 10-50% 0-30% 0-30%

10-50% 2-18%

20% proprietary/10%schlessinger 10-50% 0-30%

10-50% 0-30%

10-50% 0-30%

10-50%

10% off all Schlessinger Media titles;  free 

shipping on orders over $200 NO

list prices are subject to increase, 

not all items are returnable unless 

damaged or corrupted. Call for a 

quote on the listed books in bid. no no

shipping may apply since periodicals are 

shipped direct from the different 

subscriptions; a discount for Flipster 

(25%) will apply if EBSCO is awarded 

SOLE subscription vendor

308,000 308,000 10,000 365,000

100.0% 98.0% 100.0% 98.0% na

28 days 5-14 working days 28 days 15 business days 45-60 days ARO

0-30% 10-50% 0-30% 0%

0-30% 10-50% 0-30% 0-30%

0-30% 10-50% 0-30% 0-30%

0-30% reflected 10-50% 0-30% reflected 0-25%

0-30% 10-50% 0-30% 0%

0-30% 10-50% 0-30% 0%

Yes NO Yes yes

0-30% reflected 0-45% 0-30% reflected 0%

20% proprietary/10%schlessinger na 0-50% na 0%

na 0-35% na 0%

DO NOT OFFER PROCESSING

NA NA 25 books

attached: 0.59

unattached: Free

attached: 0.59

unattached: Free

attached 1.25

unatached 0.59

Free Free free flat fee dependent upon number of titles

Attached: 0.44 Attached: 0.44 1.25

Yes Yes na

NA NA na

100% satisfaction guarantee 100% satisfaction guarantee prompt returnfor life of book

Stacey Schafer Wendy Sidwell Tammy Herring 855.500.1710

as needed as needed on request

100% satisfaction guarantee 100% satisfaction guarantee life of the book

included in bid documents included in bid documents

mailto:bids@deebooks.com
http://www.deebooks.com/
mailto:bids@childrensplusinc.com
http://www.childrensplusinc.com/
mailto:EBSCONorthAmerica@EBSCO.com
http://www.ebsco.com/
mailto:danielle@dlbbooks.com
http://www.dlbbooks.com/
mailto:kendall@completebook.com
mailto:brena@cerebellum.com
http://www.dvdsforschools.com/


18-026-10-19 Library Books, Periodicals, Supplies, Equipment and Furniture

EFFECTIVE 11/01/18 - 10/31/19

COMPANY:

ADDRESS:

CONTACT NAME:

PHONE #:

FAX #:

E-MAIL:

WEB ADDRESS:

REQUIRED QUOTE #:

Books

Library Equipment

Library Furniture

Library Supplies

Periodicals

DVD's

Video's

CD's

Miscellaneous

DEVIATIONS:

Number of titles readily available in inventory:

Fill Rate:

Time of turn around from order:

Hardbacks

Class A Buckram binding discount:

Publisher Library binding discount:

Publisher Trade binding discount:

Paperback/Pre-Binds

Paperback discount:

Pre-bound Trade books discount:

Pre-bound paperback discount:

Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y of N

Video/Media

eBooks discount:

DVD discount:

Video discount:

Processing and Services

What is minimum order to get processing:

Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title:

MARC records price per title:

Security strips 3M tattletape price per title:

Electronic reviews available? Y or N

AR Quizzes price per quiz:

Replacement Policy:

Customer Service Rep:

Visitation Schedule:

Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise:

Send Copy of Warranty:

Educators Publishing Services

(School Specialty)

Enslow Publishing LLC

MUST USE OPAL BOOZ

Follett School Solutions, 

Inc GALE div Cengage Learning, Inc

Gareth Stevens Publishing LLC

MUST USE OPAL BOOZ Garrett Book Company

PO Box 9031

Cambridge, MA 02139-9031

101 West 23rd Street, Ste 240

New York, NY 10011

1340 Ridgeview Drive

McHenry, IL 60050

27500 Drake Rd.

Farmington Hills, MI 48331

111 East 14th Street, Ste 349

New York, NY 10003

PO Box 1588

Ada, OK 74821-1588

Customer Service Jenny Speed Naomi Bates Debra Hall Jenny Speed Cheryl York

800.225.5750 800.398.2504 877-899-8550 ext 46425 800.543.0487 800.542.2595 800.654.9366

877.980.4454 800-852-5458 877.542.2596 888.525.1560

customerservice.eps@schoolspecialty.com bids@enslow.com nbates@follett.com bidteam@cengage.com bids@gspub.com cheryl.york@garrettbooks.com

www.eps.schoolspecialty.com www.enslowpublishing.com www.titlewave.com www.gale.cengage.com www.garethstevenspublishing.com www.garrettbooks.com
7788552668 18-026-10-19

0% 25% off list price listed in catalog catalog reflects up 45% discount 0-70% varies depending imprint 25% off list price listed in catalog 30% from publishers list price

0%

0%

standard shipping: orders less than $60 will be 

charged $6.00, orders over $60 will be charged 

10% of order total. Expedited shipping charges are 

extra, prepaid and added to invoice; no assembly or 

installation NO

exceptions to the general terms 

and conditions letter in bid 

documents; special qty pricing is 

available on select dictionairies 

and thesauri

free shipping of Gale Print orders. 

Attached library processing book 

cannot be returned.  QTY Discounts 

listed in documents NO

free MARC records with 1 attached 

barcode label and 1 unattached spine 

label with orders of $900 or more

1,240

863,867 titles

4,401,159 in stock 15,500 20,000

100.0% 97-100% 99.0% 100.0% 97.0%

7-10 days processed; 21-30 days library 

porcced books 15 ARO 5-10 days

7-10 days processed; 21-30 days library 

porcced books 30 days

NA 0% NB

25% off list price 0% 25% off list price 30% off publishers list price

0% NB

NB

15% off list price 0% 15% off list price

0%

0%

yes YES YES yes

25% off list price 0-70% 25% off list price NB

NA

NA

no minimum no minimum None no minimum no minimum

free free

we will extend complimentary book 

processing for your orders to this proposal free

.65 attached

.45 unattached

free free complimentary free NC

free .59/book - available attached only complimentary free

.40 attached

.20 unattached

yes YES YES yes NO  

free NA NA free NA

www.schoolspecialty.com/returns please see attached Follett will replace or issue credit

30 days to return materials sent in error or 

incorrect please see attached will replace at no charge within 2 years

Star Rodriguez star.rodriguez@schoolspecialty.com Arlene Riley

Sue Schiel 888.511.5114 x48058  

schiel@follett.com Lindsay Smith Arlene Riley Cheryl York

contact customer service for info as requested local rep Naomi Bates TBD contact customer service for info by appointment with librarian

one year warranty please see attached 

standard manufacturers warranty on 

all items

30 days to return materials sent in error or 

incorrect please see attached NA

included please see attached na enclosed SPBP in bid documents please see attached NA

mailto:nbates@follett.com
http://www.titlewave.com/
mailto:bidteam@cengage.com
http://www.gale.cengage.com/
mailto:cheryl.york@garrettbooks.com
http://www.garrettbooks.com/
mailto:customerservice.eps@schoolspecialty.com
http://www.eps.schoolspecialty.com/
http://www.schoolspecialty.com/returns
mailto:bids@enslow.com
http://www.enslowpublishing.com/
mailto:bids@gspub.com
http://www.garethstevenspublishing.com/


18-026-10-19 Library Books, Periodicals, Supplies, Equipment and Furniture

EFFECTIVE 11/01/18 - 10/31/19

COMPANY:

ADDRESS:

CONTACT NAME:

PHONE #:

FAX #:

E-MAIL:

WEB ADDRESS:

REQUIRED QUOTE #:

Books

Library Equipment

Library Furniture

Library Supplies

Periodicals

DVD's

Video's

CD's

Miscellaneous

DEVIATIONS:

Number of titles readily available in inventory:

Fill Rate:

Time of turn around from order:

Hardbacks

Class A Buckram binding discount:

Publisher Library binding discount:

Publisher Trade binding discount:

Paperback/Pre-Binds

Paperback discount:

Pre-bound Trade books discount:

Pre-bound paperback discount:

Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y of N

Video/Media

eBooks discount:

DVD discount:

Video discount:

Processing and Services

What is minimum order to get processing:

Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title:

MARC records price per title:

Security strips 3M tattletape price per title:

Electronic reviews available? Y or N

AR Quizzes price per quiz:

Replacement Policy:

Customer Service Rep:

Visitation Schedule:

Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise:

Send Copy of Warranty:

Greenhaven Publishing LLC

MUST USE OPAL BOOZ

Gumdrop Books

(Central Programs, Inc) Ingram Library Services LLC

Junior Library Guild (MT 

Library Services Inc)

KAPCO (Kent Adhesive 

Products Company) Lakeshore Learning Material

353 3rd Avenue, Ste 255

New York, NY 10010

P.O. Box 505

Bethany, MO 64424

One Ingram Blvd

LaVergne, TN 37086

7858 Industrial Parkway

Plain City, OH 43064

1000 Cherry Street

Kent, OH 44240

2695 E. Dominguez Street 

Carson, CA 90895

Jenny Speed Nancy Crovetti Patrick McElhiney Angela Christianson Shawn Smith Amanda Henderson

844.317.7404 800.821.7199 800.937.5300 800.325.9558 ext 7276 800.791.8965 800.421.5354

844.317.7405 866.321.7199 615.213.5196 800.827.3080 800.451.3724 310.537.7990

bids@greenhaven.com wecare@gumdropbooks.com ilsbids@ingramcontent.com jlgbids@juniorlibraryguild.com book@kapco.com biddept@lakeshorelearning.com

www.greenhavenpublishing.com www.gumdropbooks.com www.ingramcontent.com/librairies www.juniorlibraryguild.com www.kapco.com www.lakeshorelearning.com
18-026-10-19 18-026-10-19 "per bid 18-026-10-19"

20% off list

catalog reflects 0-70% off; 

average 32% 0-38% catalog discounted up to 75% 5%

5%

5%

10% 5%

catalog discounted up to 75%

0-38%

0-38%

0-38% 5%

catalog discounted up to 75% 5%

NO 

Additional information in bid 

documents

Can purchase books under the State of 

Texas CoOp Purchasing program 

Ctr#715-M2 detailed processing and 

pricing info included in bid documents NO

minimum order of $50shipping 

charges will apply: orders $50 to 

$99.99, add 10%; orders $100 to 

$299.99 add 7.5%; orders $300 

and up add 5%

free shipping on all orders 

complimentary white glove delivery 

& installation on orders over 

$10,000 

2,500 3 million 966,453 items/3227 titles over 1700

100.0% 96.0% 95-100% 95.0% 99.0%

5-7 days unprocessed; 21-30 processed 10-15 business days ARO 1-2 days in stock non processed 5-7 days 7-10 business days ARO

no bid NB 0%

20% off list catalog reflects 0-70% off 10% prediscounted up to 75%

catalog reflects 0-70% off 38% prediscounted up to 75%

20% off list catalog reflects 0-40% off 36% prediscounted up to 75% 5%

no bid NB no bid

no bid 38% no bid

Yes YES Yes YES

20% off list catalog reflects 0-70% off 0% prediscounted up to 75%

no bid 25% no bid

no bid 25% no bid

no minimum no minimum no minimum no minimum no minimum

FREE

price list with options included in bid 

documents

attached: $1.19

unattached: NA

2.00 attached

unattached see attached price schedule

FREE FREE 0.25 $36 annual flat fee

FREE
.96 attached

.38 unattached

0.4
$0.50 

YES YES Yes YES

FREE Not available NB NA Free on AR Site

damages defective replaced at no charge

we will return, replace, and/or correct 

any problem or concern PERIOD see enlosed return policy lifetime replacement see attached return/replacement policy

Arlene Riley Lori Nashan Tom Grasiosi Angela Martin Anthony McKee 817.471.8518

contact customer service for info appointments at your convenience as requested NA  na

please see attached items 4 years past order date enclosed lifetime replacement see  warranty flyer

YES NA enclosed attached see warranty flyer

mailto:wecare@gumdropbooks.com
http://www.gumdropbooks.com/
mailto:jlgbids@juniorlibraryguild.com
http://www.juniorlibraryguild.com/
mailto:biddept@lakeshorelearning.com
http://www.lakeshorelearning.com/
mailto:book@kapco.com
http://www.kapco.com/
mailto:bids@greenhaven.com
http://www.greenhavenpublishing.com/
mailto:ilsbids@ingramcontent.com
http://www.ingramcontent.com/librairies


18-026-10-19 Library Books, Periodicals, Supplies, Equipment and Furniture

EFFECTIVE 11/01/18 - 10/31/19

COMPANY:

ADDRESS:

CONTACT NAME:

PHONE #:

FAX #:

E-MAIL:

WEB ADDRESS:

REQUIRED QUOTE #:

Books

Library Equipment

Library Furniture

Library Supplies

Periodicals

DVD's

Video's

CD's

Miscellaneous

DEVIATIONS:

Number of titles readily available in inventory:

Fill Rate:

Time of turn around from order:

Hardbacks

Class A Buckram binding discount:

Publisher Library binding discount:

Publisher Trade binding discount:

Paperback/Pre-Binds

Paperback discount:

Pre-bound Trade books discount:

Pre-bound paperback discount:

Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y of N

Video/Media

eBooks discount:

DVD discount:

Video discount:

Processing and Services

What is minimum order to get processing:

Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title:

MARC records price per title:

Security strips 3M tattletape price per title:

Electronic reviews available? Y or N

AR Quizzes price per quiz:

Replacement Policy:

Customer Service Rep:

Visitation Schedule:

Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise:

Send Copy of Warranty:

Lectorum Publications Inc Lerner Publishing Group The Library Store, Inc

Mackin Educational 

Resources Mitinet , Inc Opal Booz & Associates OverDrive, Inc.

205 Chubb Avenue

Lyndhurst, NJ 07071

241 First Avenue N

Minneapolis, MN 55401

301 E. South Street

Tremont, IL 61568

3505 County Road 42 West

Burnsville, MN 55306

PO Box 505

Bethany, MO 64424

2333 Lynbrook Drive 

Abilene, TX 79606

One OverDrive Way

Cleveland, OH 44125

Alex Correa Kjersten Piper Shayla Hill Grace Mundt Kelly Jo Breig Candy Freiheit Jack Darden

800.345.5946 800.328.4929 ext 344 800.548.7204 800.245.9540 800.824.6272 866.737.7910 216.573.6886

877.532.8676 800.332.1132 800.320.7706 800.369.5490 660.425.3998 866.652.3390 216.573.6889

acorrea@lectorum.com kpiper@lernerbooks.com districtbids@thelibrarystore.com bids@mackin.com wecare@mitinet.com thebookies@aol.com jdarden@overdrive.com

www.lectorum.com www.lernerbooks.com www.thelibrarystore.com www.mackin.com www.mitinet,com www.overdrive.com
18-026-10-19 TXSAISD SANANG

20% reflected in catalog 25% 10% 7% additional  to already 45% varies by publisher 0%

10%

10%

10%

10% 7% additional to already 45%

7% additional to already 45%

7% additional to already 45%

10% 7% additional to already 45% 0% 0%

20% discount reflected in catalog; 

shipping charges will apply to each 

order SHIPPING CHART in bid 

documents. $5000 and over free 

shipping; can return within 30 dats

free shipping on all orders LOCAL 

REP: Tom Rathbun 817.656.2560

Minimum order of $100 to receive 

discount. Free shipping on in stock 

supply items with minimum order. 

products shipping from manufacturer 

or by truck freight charges will be  

prepaid and added to invoice. MUST 

reference TXSAISD to receive discount NO

online subscription services 

for maintenance/organization 

of MARC records NO catalog, 

call for a quote NO  

Company does ebooks and 

digital audiobooks

over 5 million titles 100% of catalog entries

70% 98% w/in first 30 days ARO 98-100% 99% 100%

within in first 5 business days ARO approx 30-60 days 25-45 days ARO 3 business days 30 days or less, fully processed 2-4 hours ARO

NA NO NA

0% 25% additional 7% catalogs reflects 25-30%

0% 25% additional 7% 5%

0% none additional 7% 0%

0% none call for information 5%

0% none additional 7% 5%

yes YES yes  YES

NA 25% off list additional 5% 25% as reflected in catalogs 0%

NA NA additional 7% NA

NA NA additional 7% NA

$15 none none no minimum required

unattached $1.10

attached .60-.95 per book

unattached .25-.85 per book FREE FREE

$0.90 $5.00 FREE FREE

$0.50 

.30 unaffixed per book

.50 affixed per book $0.39 FREE

NO YES YES YES

NA NA no longer available NA

please see attachment if contacted w/in 30 days of delivery see warranty and replacment policy full replacement

Hilda Viskovic Aaron McMenamy Erin Segreto Candy Freiheit

NA NA contact Erin erin.segreto@mackin.com Fall & Spring as requested

see attachment can return if contacted w/in 30 days see warranty and replacment policy unconditional

NA see warranty and replacment policy YES

mailto:bids@mackin.com
http://www.mackin.com/
mailto:thebookies@aol.com
mailto:districtbids@thelibrarystore.com
http://www.thelibrarystore.com/
mailto:acorrea@lectorum.com
http://www.lectorum.com/
mailto:kpiper@lernerbooks.com
http://www.lernerbooks.com/
mailto:custserve@lernerbooks.com
mailto:wecare@mitinet.com
http://www.mitinet,com/
mailto:jdarden@overdrive.com
http://www.overdrive.com/


18-026-10-19 Library Books, Periodicals, Supplies, Equipment and Furniture

EFFECTIVE 11/01/18 - 10/31/19

COMPANY:

ADDRESS:

CONTACT NAME:

PHONE #:

FAX #:

E-MAIL:

WEB ADDRESS:

REQUIRED QUOTE #:

Books

Library Equipment

Library Furniture

Library Supplies

Periodicals

DVD's

Video's

CD's

Miscellaneous

DEVIATIONS:

Number of titles readily available in inventory:

Fill Rate:

Time of turn around from order:

Hardbacks

Class A Buckram binding discount:

Publisher Library binding discount:

Publisher Trade binding discount:

Paperback/Pre-Binds

Paperback discount:

Pre-bound Trade books discount:

Pre-bound paperback discount:

Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y of N

Video/Media

eBooks discount:

DVD discount:

Video discount:

Processing and Services

What is minimum order to get processing:

Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title:

MARC records price per title:

Security strips 3M tattletape price per title:

Electronic reviews available? Y or N

AR Quizzes price per quiz:

Replacement Policy:

Customer Service Rep:

Visitation Schedule:

Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise:

Send Copy of Warranty:

Perma-Bound Books 

(Hertzberg-New Method, 

Inc) Rainbow Book Company Renaissance Learning Inc.

The Rosen Publishing Group

MUST USE OPAL BOOZ Saddleback Educational Inc Scholastic Library Publishing, Inc

617 E. Vandalia Road

Jacksonville, IL 62650

1387 Dutch American Way

Beecher, IL 60401

2911 Peach Street

Wisconsin Rapids, WI 54495-8036

29 E 21 Street

New York, NY 10010

3120-A Pullman Street 

CostaMesa, CA 92626

90 Old Sherman Turnpike

Danbury, CT  06816

Carol Foster Michael Beechin Debra C Schoenick Jenny Speed Lisa Taraborrelli Kathy Brown

800.637.6581 800.255.0965 800.338.4204 800.237.9932 714.640.5200 800.621.1115 

800.861.8143 800.827.5988 866.558.4056 888.436.4643 714.640.5298 203.797.3478

bids@perma-bound.com sales@rainbowbookcompany.com askproposals@renaissance.com bids@rosenpub.com bids@sdlback.com kbrown@scholasticlibrary.com

www.perma-bound.com www.rainbowbookcompany.com www.renaissance.com www.rosenpublishing.com www.sdlback.com www.scholastic.com/librarypublishing
18-026-10-19 call for quote# 18-026-10-19

prediscounted up to 30% +2% web catalog reflects up to 30%

electronic books

volume discounts apply

25% off list hardcover/ebook

15% off list paperback 0% 0-40%

volume discounts apply

prediscounted up to 30% +2%

prediscounted up to 30% +2%

prediscounted up to 30% +2%

prediscounted up to 30% +2% volume discounts apply 0-40%

NO  NO

shipping and handling charges will 

apply and are based on actual weight NO

freight will be prepaid and added to 

all orders, there is a minimum $8 

charge. We charge 12%

shipping and handling is free on any order 

regardless of size when list is generated online 

& provide the web reference number with PO 

.shipping and handling is free on orders of $350 

or more for reinforced library binding & trade 

hardcover bindings all others orders and items 

are at 9% of order total

70,000 308,000

online access to over 13,000 enhanced digital 

books and daily news articles 4 million 850 1,500

95-100% 100.0% 100% 99% 95% on 1st shipment

30 days ARO 28 days

5-7 days unprocessed; 21-30 days 

processed delivery in 5-7 business days

10-14 days non library processed 21-30 days library 

processed

NB NA

NA 0-30%

no additional discount 0-30% 25% 30% off list price

no additional discount 0-30% 40% off list price

NB

no additional 0-30% 15% 0%

additional 2% off catalog/website 0-30% na

additional 2% off catalog/website 0-30% na

YES YES Yes NO

NA

no additional discount 0-30% % volume discounts apply 25%

no additional discount NA NB

no additional discount NA NB

NA

NONE NA minimum orders will aplly call rep No minimum

.44 attached

.12 unattached

attached 0.59

unattached FREE NB FREE

FREE FREE NB FREE FREE

$0.50 0.44 NB FREE FREE

YES YES NB YES YES

NA NA quizzes are included in AR subscriptions FREE

defective items can be returned no charge 100% satisfaction a call tag is issued see addendum to bid enclosed plesae see attachec flexible contact CS 800.621.1115

Lex Anne Seifert 214.886.4438 Mari Negrete 715.424.3636 x4772 Arlene Riley customer service

available upon request NA call for an appointment cantact customer service as needed

unconditional guarantee on books with 

Perma Bound bindings 100% satisfaction a call tag is issued see addendum to bid enclosed warranty is attached attached in bid packet

100% satisfaction a call tag is issued see addendum to bid enclosed YES attached in bid packet

mailto:bids@perma-bound.com
http://www.perma-bound.com/
mailto:sales@rainbowbookcompany.com
http://www.rainbowbookcompany.com/
mailto:askproposals@renaissance.com
http://www.renaissance.com/
mailto:kbrown@scholasticlibrary.com
http://www.scholastic.com/librarypublishing
mailto:bids@sdlback.com
http://www.sdlback.com/
mailto:bids@rosenpub.com
http://www.rosenpublishing.com/


18-026-10-19 Library Books, Periodicals, Supplies, Equipment and Furniture

EFFECTIVE 11/01/18 - 10/31/19

COMPANY:

ADDRESS:

CONTACT NAME:

PHONE #:

FAX #:

E-MAIL:

WEB ADDRESS:

REQUIRED QUOTE #:

Books

Library Equipment

Library Furniture

Library Supplies

Periodicals

DVD's

Video's

CD's

Miscellaneous

DEVIATIONS:

Number of titles readily available in inventory:

Fill Rate:

Time of turn around from order:

Hardbacks

Class A Buckram binding discount:

Publisher Library binding discount:

Publisher Trade binding discount:

Paperback/Pre-Binds

Paperback discount:

Pre-bound Trade books discount:

Pre-bound paperback discount:

Is cataloging available for paperbacks? Y of N

Video/Media

eBooks discount:

DVD discount:

Video discount:

Processing and Services

What is minimum order to get processing:

Shelf ready processing & unattached price per title:

MARC records price per title:

Security strips 3M tattletape price per title:

Electronic reviews available? Y or N

AR Quizzes price per quiz:

Replacement Policy:

Customer Service Rep:

Visitation Schedule:

Warranty of Guarantee on Merchandise:

Send Copy of Warranty:

School Specialty, Inc Textbook Warehouse

W.T. Cox 

Subscriptions

W6316 Design Drive

Greenville, WI 54942

936 Curie Dr

Alpharetta, GA  30005

201 Village Road

Shallotte, NC 28470

Customer Service Delores Knighting Debra M Knox

888.388.3224 800.796.9152 800.571.9554

800.796.9154 877.755.6274

bidwestnotices@schoolspecialty.com info@tbwarehouse.com dknox@qwtcox.com

www.schoolspecialty.com www.textbookwarehouse.com www.wtcox.com
7788527176 18-026-10-19

33% 37% off publishers cover price

33%

14%

33%

23% w/exceptions

33%

33%

free non-parcel S&H; freight is prepaid an 

addedto invoice where applicable; chart 

included in bid documents NO

due to publisher 

restrictions some titles 

are considered non-

discountable. 

Publications over $100 

are non-discountable.

2000+ 300,000

80.0% 98%

7-10 business days

45 days after 

orders/payments

NA

NA

flate rate of $4.75 each

37% off publisher list price

37% off publisher list price

0%

no

0%

0%

0%

NA

0.32 each

refer to www.schoolspecialty.com/returns

Darlene Wheeler Karen Cashman

on request as needed

proprietary products one year warranty

on website

mailto:info@tbwarehouse.com
http://www.textbookwarehouse.com/
mailto:dknox@qwtcox.com
http://www.wtcox.com/
mailto:bidwestnotices@schoolspecialty.com
http://www.schoolspecialty.com/


18-026-10-19 Library Bid

Opal Booz & Associates

2333 Lynbrook Drive
Abilene, TX 79606

Candy Freiheit
866.737.7910

866.652.3390
thebookies@aol.com

COMPANY SHIPPING PROCESSING 

CATALOG 

REFLECTED 

DISCOUNT
ABDO/Spotlight/Magic Wagon Free Free 25%
Bearport Publishing Free Free 25%

Enslow Free Free 25%
Gareth Stevens Free Free 25%

Crabtree Free Free 25%
Mason Crest Publishers Free Free catalog price
Cavendish Square Publishing Free Free 25%

Cherry Lake Publishing/Sleeping Bear Free Free 25%
Children's Plus Free Free Loose catalog price

Rosen Publishing Free Free 25%
The Child's World Free Free 25%
Jappleseed Media Free Free 25%

Pegasus Free Free contact rep
Greenhaven/Lucent/Kidhaven Free Free catalog price
Roure Free Free 30%



ITEM - SUPPLIES KAPCO

Library 

Store

School 

Specialty
PRICE PRICE PRICE

1
Plastic/Mylar Covers (book jackets) 2ml, 7 1/8-8"Hx18L Heavy-

duty acid free

2
Clear, polyester barcode protectors 17.22 

500/roll 15.11 7.83 500/roll

3 date due strips 3.75Hx2.75W
4 mending books kits 102.47

5 magazine binder/cover, clear vinyl front 8x11 16.68

6 book & paper cleaner 11oz
7 protective film, clear, archival quality, polyester film 18.13

8 library classification labels 1x.75" self adhesive
9 paperback book cover 8" 4mil

10 paperback book cover 8" 2mil 29.54

11 B2 1000/box 3M tattle tape security strips 234.95

12 B1 1000/box 3M tattle tape security strips 259.95

13 label protectors by the roll (1000) round corners 1.5x2" 43.29 9.47

14 label protectors by the roll (1000) round corners 1.25x3" 45.19 6.79

15 laser.inkjet processing lables  5500 per box, round corners 3.93

16 labels 3000 per box 1x2 5/8" 45.89 13.85

17 un-du adhesive remover 4 oz 4.22

18 book repair glue acid free 8 oz 8.20 16oz 6.38 3.73

19 premium filament tape .5"x60yrds 11.89 2.64

20 book tape 845-2 6.44 6.79 4.33

21 book tape 845-3 9.74 11.04 6.61

22 Magic mend tape 3/4" 4.21 2.13

23 bone folders 3.73

24 metal label peeler 6.79 2.38 plastic*

25
dura guard covers adjustable book covers 1 & 2" spine 10x16 & 12.5X20"

26 snap on replacement pens
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